
 

 
 

The most convenient way to gain access to St Christopher's Fellowship’s head office 
at 1 Putney High Street is by Public Transport…. 
 
Mainline Rail  
 
Putney Station has mainline rail connections with Waterloo, Clapham Junction and 
Vauxhall. There are approximately 10 trains each hour from Clapham Junction and the 
journey takes approximately 4 minutes. From Putney Station turn right into Putney 
High Street and walk towards Putney Bridge (5 minutes). Immediately after the Odeon 
Cinema and before the Church, turn right into Church Square (the Courtyard). The 
entrance to St Christopher's Fellowship and Globet (1 Putney High Street) is through 
the far left corner of the square and to the right of the Rocket Restaurant, at the base 
of Putney Wharf Tower (please see arrow on map below).  
 
London Underground (Tube) 
 
From Putney Bridge tube station, turn left when you leave the station, then right into 
Ranelagh Gardens. Approximately 50 meters along Ranelagh Gardens veer left, 
which will lead you into Willow Bank.  If you walk up the stone steps, this will bring you 
onto the Northern end of Putney Bridge.  From here, if you look South across the 
bridge, you will see Putney Wharf Tower, a large glass-fronted landmark tower, to the 
side of Putney Church. Walk across the bridge, turn left into Church Square (the 
Courtyard) and proceed as above for mainline rail. The walk from Putney Bridge to St 
Christopher's is approximately 6 minutes.  
 
From East Putney tube station, turn left into Upper Richmond Road. After 
approximately 100 meters, turn right into Oxford Road.  Once at the end of the road, 
turn left into Putney Bridge Road, then take the third right into Brewhouse Lane.  Walk 
to the river and left around Putney Wharf Tower. St Christopher's entrance is straight 
ahead. The walk from East Putney to St Christopher's is approximately 14 minutes. 
 
NB. Brewhouse Lane is referred to as Brewhouse Street in the London A to Z and on 
www.streetmap.co.uk and www.multimap.co.uk , but is signposted Brewhouse Lane. 
 
Bus 
 
Local bus numbers are – 37 & 337 (Putney Station), 220 & 270 (Putney Bridge Road), 
414 (Putney Bridge Station), 265 (Lower Richmond Road), 14, 39, 85, 93, 424 & 430 
(Putney Bridge). 
 
By Vehicle 
 
There is very limited and restricted parking in the area. 
 
St Christopher’s Fellowship, 1 Putney High Street, is located between Putney High 
Street and Putney Bridge Road.   
 

http://www.streetmap.co.uk/
http://www.multimap.co.uk/
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From the North, you can approach via the A308, A219 or the A308 which all run over 
Putney Bridge. Once over the bridge, turn left into Putney Bridge Road, then turn left 
again and this will bring you into Brewhouse Lane.   
 
 From the South, coming from the A219, travel down until you reach the cross roads of 
Putney Hill and Upper Richmond Road, turn right at the traffic lights onto Upper 
Richmond Road, take your first left onto Oxford Road and proceed to the end.  Turn 
left onto Putney Bridge Road and take your third right into Brewhouse Lane.   
 
From the East, take the A3209 through Wandsworth, into Putney Bridge Road, before 
turning right into Brewhouse Lane. 
 
There is a ramp to your right, pull into the ramp and you will need to collect a day pass 
from the concierge’s office.  Once out of the car park, walk towards the river and 
around the glass building, you will then see a glass door with our company logo on the 
right hand side. 
 
NB. Brewhouse Lane is referred to as Brewhouse Street in the London A to Z and on 
www.streetmap.co.uk and www.multimap.co.uk , but is signposted Brewhouse Lane. 
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1 Putney High Street, London, SW15 1SZ 
Tel. No.: 0208 780 7800  Fax. No.: 0208 780 7801 

Info@stchris.org.uk  
Map of Putney 

Bus Services to Putney 
National Rail Enquiries - Services to Putney 

Tube Map 
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